

Date: 4 April 2025 Our Ref: RFI5058 Tel: 0300 1234 500

Email: infogov@homesengland.gov.uk

By Email Only

Dear

RE: Request for Information – RFI5058

Thank you for your recent email, which was processed under the Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR).

You requested the following information:

A list of all properties that have so far been listed for sale on the <u>Section 106 Affordable Housing Clearing</u>
Service, including their:

- a. location
- b. the broader development scheme the property is part of, if this information is held
- c. when the property was listed on the clearing service
- d. the asking price (if any) that the property has been listed with
- e. the entity looking to sell the property
- f. who (if anyone) the property has been sold to
- g. how much the property has been sold for

Response

We can inform you that we do hold some of this information. Regulation 9(1) provides that an authority must provide advice and assistance to applicants and in accordance with this we can advise the primary purpose of the service is to share opportunities regarding uncontracted and unsold homes, most of which have yet to be built. Further information is available online via the following link:

https://www.gov.uk/government/collections/the-section-106-affordable-housing-clearing-service

2nd Floor The Lumen St James Boulevard, Newcastle Helix Newcastle upon Tyne, NE4 5BZ





Date: 4 April 2025 Our Ref: RFI5058 Tel: 0300 1234 500

Email: infogov@homesengland.gov.uk

We hold information relating to location, development, when the property was listed and the entity looking to sell the property or opportunity. However, we are withholding this information from disclosure under the following exception:

Regulation 12(5)(e) - Confidentiality of commercial or industrial information

Under regulation 12(5)(e) of the EIR, Homes England may refuse to disclose information to the extent that its disclosure would adversely affect the confidentiality of commercial or industrial information where such confidentiality is provided by law to protect a legitimate economic interest.

Four elements are required for Regulation 12(5)(e) to be engaged:

- 1) The information is commercial or industrial in nature;
 The requested environmental information consists of information that has been provided to Homes
 England by commercial organisations about their business. Therefore it is commercial in nature as it
 relates to commercial activity.
- 2) Confidentiality is provided by law;
 The withheld information is subject to confidentiality provided by law under a common law duty of confidence. The information has a common law duty of confidence because it is not trivial and not in the public domain.
- 3) The confidentiality is providing a legitimate economic interest;

 There is a legitimate economic interest in commercial organisations being able to conduct their business and seek partnership and collaboration away from public scrutiny. If the confidentiality of this information was breached it would harm the ability of third parties to collaborate effectively. There is a legitimate economic interest in protecting the ability of Homes England and third parties to negotiate in current and future commercial agreements.
- 4) The confidentiality would be adversely affected by disclosure; Disclosure would result in third parties gaining access to commercially valuable information. Disclosure of the confidential information would harm the ability of Homes England to achieve good value for public money.

2nd Floor The Lumen St James Boulevard, Newcastle Helix Newcastle upon Tyne, NE4 5BZ





Date: 4 April 2025 Our Ref: RFI5058 Tel: 0300 1234 500

Email: infogov@homesengland.gov.uk

Public Interest Test

Regulation 12(5)(e) is subject to the public interest test. Once the exception has been engaged it is then necessary to consider the balance of the public interest in maintaining the exception or disclosing the information.

Under regulation 12(2) the public authority must apply a presumption in favour of disclosure, in both engaging the exception and carrying out the public interest test. In relation to engaging the exception, this means that there must be clear evidence that disclosure would have the adverse effect listed in 12(5).

Factors in favour of disclosure

- Homes England acknowledge that there is a presumption in disclosure regarding environmental information as well as a public interest in promoting transparency in how we undertake our work and allocate public money; and
- Homes England acknowledges that there is a public interest in the development of affordable housing.

Factors in favour of withholding

- The Section 106 Affordable Housing Clearing Service (the 'Service') has been established to support the delivery of Section 106 affordable housing. Access to the Service is explicitly limited to housebuilders, registered providers and local authorities all of whom have been verified by Homes England to ensure they have a genuine interest and role in selling, buying and/or enabling the selling and buying of Section 106 affordable homes. Housebuilders have shared information with Homes England on the understanding that it will only be shared with verified parties. Therefore, disclosure is likely to harm the trust and cooperation with our partners. This would undermine the Service, which would not be in the public interest and would not be in accordance with Homes England's core ambition to build trusting and collaborative relationships with our partners.
- The information requested is commercial in nature, and its release would be likely to prejudice the commercial interests of Homes England and other interested parties. Disclosure is likely to result in housebuilders being less inclined to shared information with Homes England, especially where they felt their commercial interests would be put at risk. This would negatively impact the development of affordable housing across England. This would not be in public interest and would not be in accordance with our strategic objectives.

2nd Floor The Lumen St James Boulevard, Newcastle Helix Newcastle upon Tyne, NE4 5BZ





Date: 4 April 2025 Our Ref: RFI5058 Tel: 0300 1234 500

Email: infogov@homesengland.gov.uk

- Releasing this information into the public domain would be likely to prejudice any future intervention Homes England may take to support its partners with Section 106 affordable housing delivery.
- Homes England has been unable to identify a wider public interest in disclosing the information requested.

Having considered the arguments for and against disclosure of the information, we have concluded that at this time, the balance of the public interest favours non-disclosure.

The full text of Regulation 12(5)(e) in the legislation can be found via the following link: https://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2004/3391/regulation/12/made

Regulation 12(4)(a) – Information not Held

Under regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, Homes England may refuse to disclose information if the requested information is not held by that public authority. We can confirm that Homes England does not hold information relating to the following questions as set out in your request:

- (d) the asking price (if any) that the property has been listed with
- (f) who (if anyone) the property has been sold to
- (g) how much the property has been sold for

When relying on Regulation 12(4)(a), Homes England must also advise details of any other public authority to whom the requestor could redirect their request to, and in accordance with this we can advise that you may wish to contact Local Authorities who may hold this information about section 106 properties.

Right to make Representations

If you are not happy with the way in which your request has been handled, you may request a reconsideration of our response (Internal Review). You can make this representation by writing to Homes England via the details below, quoting the reference number at the top of this letter.

Email: infogov@homesengland.gov.uk

The Information Governance Team Homes England

2nd Floor The Lumen St James Boulevard, Newcastle Helix Newcastle upon Tyne, NE4 5BZ





Date: 4 April 2025 Our Ref: RFI5058 Tel: 0300 1234 500

Email: infogov@homesengland.gov.uk

2nd Floor The Lumen St James Boulevard Newcastle Helix Newcastle upon Tyne NE4 5BZ

Your request for reconsideration must be made in writing, explain why you wish to appeal, and be received within 40 working days of the date of this response (Reg 11(2)). Failure to meet this criteria may lead to your request being refused.

Upon receipt, your request for reconsideration will be passed to an independent party not involved in your original request. We aim to issue a response within 20 working days.

You may also complain to the Information Commissioner's Office (ICO) however, the Information Commissioner does usually expect the internal review procedure to be exhausted in the first instance.

The Information Commissioner's details can be found via the following link https://ico.org.uk/

Please note that the contents of your request and this response are also subject to the Freedom of Information Act 2000. Homes England may be required to disclose your request and our response accordingly.

Yours sincerely,

The Information Governance Team

For Homes England

2nd Floor The Lumen St James Boulevard, Newcastle Helix Newcastle upon Tyne, NE4 5BZ

