Reference: 2025-042

Thank you for your email in which you requested the following information under the Freedom
of Information Act 2000 (FOIA):

This is an information request relating to staff expenses over £500.

Please include the following information for the last four financial years, 2021-22, 2022-
23, and 2023-24:

1. The total amount claimed in expenses by senior staff annually.
A breakdown of expenses by category (e.g., travel, accommodation, meals,
hospitality, subsistence, training, etc.).

3. The total amount claimed by the most expensive individual claimant (job title
only) in each of those years.

4. If available, a breakdown of expenses for members of the senior leadership
team (e.g. Chief Executive, Directors), including job titles and total expenses
per individual per year.

Response
We do not hold the information in the format you have requested.

Please see below table for the SFO’s total expense costs for financial years 2021 to 2024.

Year Expenses
2021-22 £154,000
2022-23 £174,000
2023-24 £263,000

We publish the Director and senior management expenses on our website on an quarterly
basis, please see this information here: 2024-25 Director and senior management team
expenses - GOV.UK. For information from previous years, please visit the National Archive
website: Archive Timeline - UK Government Web Archive

We do not hold a breakdown of expenses in any other format.


https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/2024-25-director-and-senior-management-team-expenses
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/2024-25-director-and-senior-management-team-expenses
https://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/ukgwa/timeline1/https:/www.sfo.gov.uk/

