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REQUEST FOR INFORMATION: Horse Export Statistics

Thank you for your request for information of 15th September about Horse Export
Statistics. APHA have handled your request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000
(FOIA).

Your information request and our response are set out below.

“1) How many equidae were exported live from the UK for slaughter each year for the
years 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022 and so far in 2023?”

There is no export health certificate for the purpose of exporting live equines for slaughter,
therefore this information is not held by APHA.

“2) How many shipments of equidae were exported live from the UK for slaughter each
year for the years 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022 and so far in 20237?”

There is no export health certificate for the purpose of exporting live equines for slaughter,
therefore this information is not held by APHA.

“3) Which countries were equidae exported to when they were exported live for slaughter
from the UK for each individual for the years 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022 and so far in
202377

There is no export health certificate for the purpose of exporting live equines for slaughter,
therefore this information is not held by APHA.

You also requested the following information about equine skin which was amalgamated
with your original request.

“4) What countries did the UK export equine skins to during 2021, 2022 and so far to
202377

APHA issued Export Health Certificates for the export of equine skins to the following
countries in the table below.
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2021 2022 2023
El Salvador |Belgium Belgium

Indonesia

Philippines

“5) How many tonnes/kilos (or number of equine skins) were exported from the UK in
each individual year 2021, 2022 and so far to 2023?”

This is not information we can extract from any of our systems therefore APHA cannot
provide this data.

“6) How many tonnes/kilos (or number of equine skins) were imported into the UK in each
individual year 2021, 2022 and so far to 20237

Please see table below for the Rest of World imports data extracted for years 2021 and
2023. There were no imports in 2022.

Sum of Commodities

Ear Total Net Weight
2021 6037.5
2023 12307.3
Grand Total 18344.8

Please be aware, we cannot provide the total number of equine skins imported from the
EU into the UK due to the data not being broken down into species.

The information that we have provided is a true reflection of the information that we have
access to. We cannot guarantee the accuracy of this data, as we can only rely on the
information that has been input into external customer facing systems by third parties.
Information disclosed in response to this FOI request is releasable to the public. In
keeping with the spirit and effect of the FOIA and the government’s Transparency
Agenda, this letter and the information disclosed to you may be placed on GOV.UK,
together with any related information that will provide a key to its wider context. No
information identifying you will be placed on the GOV.UK website.

An Annex is attached which explains the copyright that applies to the information being
released to you and contact details should you be unhappy with the service you have
received.

If you have any queries about this letter, please contact the Access to Information Team
at the email address below or postal address at the top of this letter.

Yours sincerely
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Access to Information Team
enquiries@apha.gov.uk
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Annex
Copyright

The information supplied to you continues to be protected by copyright. You are free to
use it for your own purposes, including for private study and non-commercial research,
and for any other purpose authorised by an exception in current copyright law.
Documents (except photographs or logos) can also be used in the UK without requiring
permission for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use, for example
commercial publication, would require the permission of the copyright holder.

Most documents produced by APHA will be protected by Crown Copyright. Most Crown
copyright information can be re-used under the Open Government Licence. For information
about the OGL and about re-using Crown Copyright information please see The National
Archives website.

Copyright in other documents may rest with a third party. For information about
obtaining permission from a third party see the Intellectual Property Office’s website.

Complaints

If you are unhappy with the service you have received in relation to your request, you
may make a complaint or appeal against our decision under section 17(7) of the FOIA
within 40 working days of the date of this letter. Please write to the Access to
Information Team at the address at the top of this letter or email
enquiries@apha.gov.uk and the team will arrange for an internal review of your case.

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, section 50 of the FOIA
gives you the right to apply directly to the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a
decision. Please note that generally the ICO cannot make a decision unless you have
first exhausted APHA’s own complaints procedure.

The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner’s Office
Woycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Please click here for further contact details.
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