
 

Freedom of Information Manager 

Ministry of Defence Police 

Palmer Pavilion, 

Building 666, 

RAF Wyton, Huntingdon, 

Cambs, PE28 2EA 

 

 

E-mail: 

 

MDP-FOI-DP@mod.gov.uk  

 Our Ref: eCase: FOI 2023/05527 

RFI: 129/23 

Date: 25 May 2023 

Dear  
 
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000: MINISTRY OF DEFENCE POLICE: NUMBER 

OF CASES CAUSING INTENTIONAL HARASSMENT, ALARM OR DISTRESS (CODE 

125/09) 

 
We refer to your email dated 02 May 2023 to the Ministry of Defence Police (MDP), which 
was acknowledged on 02 May April 2023. 
 
We are treating your email as a request for information in accordance with the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 (FOIA 2000).  
 
In your email you requested the following information: 
 
1. Please provide the number of cases of intentional harassment, alarm or distress 

(Public Order Act 1986 Sec. 4A) reported to your force between January 1st and 

December 31st 2022. Your force may record this under classification code 125/09. 

If held, please outline how many cases of causing intentional harassment, alarm 

or distress include a sexual element (for example, have been recorded alongside 

another crime type as a sexual offence, or specifies 'sexual harassment') 

 

2. Please provide the above totals broken down by: age of victim (just 'child' or 

'adult' is fine, but more detail is welcome if within the cost limit) and crime 

outcome. 

Note: Please include reported crime, not *just* 'recorded' crime in the above totals. 
Where reports have not progressed to a recorded crime, please flag this as a crime 
outcome (for example, 'reported, not recorded'). 
 
A search for information has now been completed by the MDP and I can confirm that we do 
hold information relevant to your request.   
 

Ministry 
of Defence Police 

- 

Freedom of Information Manager 

Ministry of Defence Police 

Palmer Pavilion, 

Building 666, 

RAF Wyton, Huntingdon, 

Cambs, PE28 2EA 

 

 

E-mail: 

 

MDP-FOI-DP@mod.gov.uk  

 Our Ref: eCase: FOI 2023/05527 

RFI: 129/23 

Date: 25 May 2023 

Dear  
 
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000: MINISTRY OF DEFENCE POLICE: NUMBER 

OF CASES CAUSING INTENTIONAL HARASSMENT, ALARM OR DISTRESS (CODE 

125/09) 

 
We refer to your email dated 02 May 2023 to the Ministry of Defence Police (MDP), which 
was acknowledged on 02 May April 2023. 
 
We are treating your email as a request for information in accordance with the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 (FOIA 2000).  
 
In your email you requested the following information: 
 
1. Please provide the number of cases of intentional harassment, alarm or distress 

(Public Order Act 1986 Sec. 4A) reported to your force between January 1st and 

December 31st 2022. Your force may record this under classification code 125/09. 

If held, please outline how many cases of causing intentional harassment, alarm 

or distress include a sexual element (for example, have been recorded alongside 

another crime type as a sexual offence, or specifies 'sexual harassment') 

 

2. Please provide the above totals broken down by: age of victim (just 'child' or 

'adult' is fine, but more detail is welcome if within the cost limit) and crime 

outcome. 

Note: Please include reported crime, not *just* 'recorded' crime in the above totals. 
Where reports have not progressed to a recorded crime, please flag this as a crime 
outcome (for example, 'reported, not recorded'). 
 
A search for information has now been completed by the MDP and I can confirm that we do 
hold information relevant to your request.   
 

Ministry 
of Defence Police 

- 

Freedom of Information Manager 

Ministry of Defence Police 

Palmer Pavilion, 

Building 666, 

RAF Wyton, Huntingdon, 

Cambs, PE28 2EA 

 

 

E-mail: 

 

MDP-FOI-DP@mod.gov.uk  

 Our Ref: eCase: FOI 2023/05527 

RFI: 129/23 

Date: 25 May 2023 

Dear  
 
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000: MINISTRY OF DEFENCE POLICE: NUMBER 

OF CASES CAUSING INTENTIONAL HARASSMENT, ALARM OR DISTRESS (CODE 

125/09) 

 
We refer to your email dated 02 May 2023 to the Ministry of Defence Police (MDP), which 
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We refer to your email dated 02 May 2023 to the Ministry of Defence Police (MDP), which 
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We are treating your email as a request for information in accordance with the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 (FOIA 2000).  
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Date: 25 May 2023 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000: MINISTRY OF DEFENCE POLICE: NUMBER 
OF CASES CAUSING INTENTIONAL HARASSMENT, ALARM OR DISTRESS (CODE 
125/09) 

We refer to your email dated 02 May 2023 to the Ministry of Defence Police (MOP), which 
was acknowledged on 02 May April 2023. 

We are treating your email as a request for information in accordance with the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 (FOIA 2000). 

In your email you requested the following information: 

1. Please provide the number of cases of intentional harassment, alarm or distress 
(Public Order Act 1986 Sec. 4A) reported to your force between January 1st and 
December 31st 2022. Your force may record this under classification code 125/09. 
If held, please outline how many cases of causing intentional harassment, alarm 
or distress include a sexual element (for example, have been recorded alongside 
another crime type as a sexual offence, or specifies 'sexual harassment') 

2. Please provide the above totals broken down by: age of victim (just 'child' or 
'adult' is fine, but more detail is welcome if within the cost limit) and crime 
outcome. 

Note: Please include reported crime, not *just* 'recorded' crime in the above totals. 
Where reports have not progressed to a recorded crime, please flag this as a crime 
outcome (for example, 'reported, not recorded'). 

A search for information has now been completed by the MOP and I can confirm that we do 
hold information relevant to your request. 
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1. Please provide the number of cases of intentional harassment, alarm or distress 

(Public Order Act 1986 Sec. 4A) reported to your force between January 1st and 

December 31st 2022. Your force may record this under classification code 125/09. 

If held, please outline how many cases of causing intentional harassment, alarm 

or distress include a sexual element (for example, have been recorded alongside 

another crime type as a sexual offence, or specifies 'sexual harassment') 

8, 2 of which include a sexual element. 
 
This data includes reported and recorded crimes. 
 
2. Please provide the above totals broken down by: age of victim (just 'child' or 

'adult' is fine, but more detail is welcome if within the cost limit) and crime 

outcome. 

Age of victim: 
6 adults, 1 adult and child, 1 child 
 
Crime outcome: 
4 - transferred to another agency (includes Home Office Police) 
2 - evidential difficulties 
1 - not in the public interest 
1 - ongoing investigation 
 
This data includes reported and recorded crimes. 
 
If you wish to complain about the handling of your request, or the content of this response, 

you can request an independent internal review by contacting the Information Rights 

Compliance team, Ground Floor, MOD Main Building, Whitehall, SW1A 2HB (e-mail CIO-

FOI-IR@mod.gov.uk).  

Please note that any request for an internal review should be made within 40 working days 
of the date of this response.  
 
If you remain dissatisfied following an internal review, you may raise your complaint directly 
to the Information Commissioner under the provisions of Section 50 of the Freedom of 
Information Act. Please note that the Information Commissioner will not normally investigate 
your case until the MOD internal review process has been completed. The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, 
Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF. Further details of the role and powers of the 
Information Commissioner can be found on the Commissioner's website at 
https://ico.org.uk/. 
 
Yours sincerely  
 
MDP Secretariat and Freedom of Information Office  
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2. Please provide the above totals broken down by: age of victim (just 'child' or 

'adult' is fine, but more detail is welcome if within the cost limit) and crime 
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Please note that any request for an internal review should be made within 40 working days 
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