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         Information Governance Team 

By Email Only          Homes England  
           Windsor House – 6th Floor 
           50 Victoria Street 

London 
SW1H 0TL 

 
 
 
Dear  
 
RE: Request for Information – RFI3536 
 
Thank you for your request for information which was processed in accordance with the Freedom of Information 
Act 2000 (FOIA). 
 
You requested the following information:  

 
I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following information from 

Homes England regarding a property development scheme involving Morris Homes (Midland) Limited which is 

part of the Morris Homes Group and the Homes and Communities Agency which is now known as Homes 

England. The property development and property marketing ran in phases from 2012 - 2016. 

Please may you provide me with: 

1) Complete unredacted copies of all documents related to contracts and agreements made between Morris 

Homes (Midland) Limited and the Homes and Communities Agency regarding the Vista Peterborough property 

development. The development was also known as Cripple Sidings and the Carbon Challenge. 

2) Complete unredacted copy of the Vista Peterborough scheme appraisal report produced following completion 

of the Vista Peterborough development.  

3) Complete unredacted copies of the minutes of any meetings, and/or any agreement reached, held with the 

Homes England, and/or its predecessor agency, and Morris Homes, relating to the property development 

scheme, transfer of property Freehold under the scheme and division of profits from the Vista Peterborough 

development scheme. 

We wrote to you on 13 August to advise that a qualified exemption applied to the information held that fell within 

the scope of your request and that we were considering the arguments for and against disclosure. In response you 

provided the following arguments which we have taken into account when considering our response:  

1. Recent global weather and natural disaster events demonstrate the harm that current modes of living are 
causing the environment. Members of the public are very interested to know the outcome of schemes such as 
Vista Peterborough that seek to address environmental issues related to carbon emissions from people's homes. 
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Consumers need good quality information to avoid confusion: https://www.bbc.co.uk/news/science-
environment-58320578 

2. Members of the public purchased eco-friendly properties from the Vista Peterborough scheme but there is no 
information publicly available to them regarding the ecological objectives of the Vista Peterborough 
development and whether the scheme was successful in reaching objectives agreed with HCA. 

3. Members of the public, who purchased Vista Peterborough properties, were given information regarding the 
HCA/Morris Homes scheme and agreement during the sales process which formed the basis of consumers' 
purchasing decisions. Without the requested information regarding the scheme those consumers cannot 
determine whether the information provided by sales advisors was correct. For example, Morris Homes sales 
advisors told potential buyers that the properties had to be sold as leasehold tenure due to an agreement 
between HCA and Morris Homes. Buyers were also advised that the eco-friendly property features were 
stipulated by the HCA. Without full details of the scheme agreed between HCA and Morris Homes, it is not 
possible for members of the public to confirm whether information provided to them at the point of sale was 
correct. 

4. The public has an interest in knowing the full results of a scheme to provide eco-friendly housing to help them 
identify good quality and well operated eco-friendly housing schemes now and in the future. 

5. Present owners of the Vista Peterborough properties, members of the public, were invoiced 2017-2020 for items 
in the estate Annual Service Charges which refer to "Travel Coordination". The Property Management company 
advised Vista property owners that this charge is for a travel coordination web site for Vista Peterborough 
residents which was never set up by Morris Homes. Without the full information about the HCA and Morris 
Homes scheme for the Vista development, it is impossible for members of the public to query whether a "Travel 
Coordination" web site was an HCA requirement for the Vista scheme, whether the requirement was met by 
Morris Homes and what benefits Vista property owners and estate residents have missed out on due to the web 
site not being provided. 

6. Members of the public who own Vista properties seek to purchase their freehold. During that process it is 
necessary to review, understand and possibly challenge any restrictive covenants or other obligations 
associated with the freehold title deeds. Without the full information about the agreement between HCA and 
Morris Homes it will be more difficult for leaseholders seeking to purchase their property freehold to confirm 
whether restrictive covenants are a form of "fleecehold" or whether they truly benefit neighbours and the estate 
as requested by HCA and should be allowed to remain attached to the freehold title deed. 

 
Response 
We can confirm that we do hold some of the requested information. For clarity, we will address each of your original 
points in turn.  
 
1) Complete unredacted copies of all documents related to contracts and agreements made between Morris 

Homes (Midland) Limited and the Homes and Communities Agency regarding the Vista Peterborough 

property development. The development was also known as Cripple Sidings and the Carbon Challenge. 

Please find attached the following annexes which constitute the recorded information that Homes England 

holds in scope of this part of your request: 

Annex A – Unilateral Undertaking dated 16 March 2011 

Annex B – Lease dated 25 March 2011 

Annex C – Deed of Variation to Lease dated 20 December 2012 
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Section 40 – Personal information 
We have redacted information on the grounds that in constitutes third party personal data and therefore 
engages section 40(2) of the FOIA.  
 
To disclose personal data, such as names and signatures could lead to the identification of third parties and 
would breach one or more of the data protection principles. 
 
Section 40 is an absolute exemption which means that we do not need to consider the public interest in 
disclosure. Once it is established that the information is personal data of a third party and release would breach 
one or more of the data protection principles, then the exemption is engaged. 
 
The full text in the legislation can be found on the following link: 
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/section/40 

 
 
 
2) Complete unredacted copy of the Vista Peterborough scheme appraisal report produced following completion 

of the Vista Peterborough development.  

We can confirm that we do hold the information requested. However we are withholding the document from 

disclosure under the following FOIA exemption:  

Section 43 - Commercial interests 
Under section 43(2) Homes England is not obliged to disclose information that would, or would be likely to, 
prejudice the commercial interests of any party. 
 
The appraisal held (Project Review Report) engages section 43(2) of the FOIA as it is commercial in nature and 
its release would be likely to prejudice the commercial interests of Homes England and other interested parties 
to the information.  
 
Homes England has identified that the information requested, if released, would be likely to prejudice Homes 
England’s commercial and reputational position as a partner in the market and affect the ability of our partners 
to operate in a commercial market.   
  
Section 43 is a qualified exemption. This means that once we have decided that the exemption is engaged, 
Homes England must carry out a public interest test to assess whether or not it is in the wider public interest for 
the information to be disclosed. 
 
Arguments in favour of disclosure: 

• Homes England acknowledges there is a general public interest in promoting accountability, 
transparency, public understanding and involvement in how Homes England undertakes its work and 
how it spends public money; and 

• Homes England acknowledges there is an interest in the financial outcomes of spending of public 
money.  
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Arguments in favour of withholding: 

• The withheld document has been produced by a third party who has been procured to undertake works 
by Homes England. To release the content of a document produced relatively recently (2018) would 
inform other suppliers of similar services of the content of a competitor’s output. This would be likely to 
negatively impact our ability to procure services at market value from future partners. If organisations 
felt the content of work undertaken would be available to their competitors, they would be unlikely to 
want to provide these services to Homes England. This would mean that Homes England would not be 
able to procure and engage the best services. Both value for money and quality of applicant could be 
adversely affected. It would not be in the public interest for Homes England to have limited access to 
procured or engaged services; 

• Disclosure would also undermine confidence in Homes England by the wider industry, which would 
deter partners and developers from approaching us with proposals if they felt their sensitive 
commercial information would be released. If revealed to a wider audience, it would affect future 
negotiations for the same or similar services. Homes England needs to attract the developers who will 
apply the funding we have provided to deliver the homes that the market needs. Developers would be 
deterred from working with us and accessing our funding if they thought that their sensitive commercial 
and financial information would be disclosed, which would not be in the public interest; 

• Releasing the information would be likely to negatively impact future development processes and 
proposals as interested parties may feel unable to provide all the relevant information necessary for fear 
of disclosure. This would impact the ability of Government officials to make effective, informed 
decisions regarding allocation of public funds; 

• Releasing the information could reveal financial information of a third party which may in turn affect 
their commercial interests. The consequences of releasing data that is part of a wider ongoing matter 
could damage our relationships with partners and put other potential funding allocations at risk. This 
would not be in the public interest as this could put potential homes in jeopardy and affect Homes 
England’s ability to deliver against its objectives in our strategic plan; and 

• Homes England has been unable to identify a wider public interest in disclosing the information 
requested. 

 
Having considered the arguments for and against disclosure of the information, we have concluded that at this 
time, the balance of the public interest favours non-disclosure. 
 
The full text of the legislation can be found on the following link: 
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/section/43 
 
 
Section 41 - Information provided in confidence 
The information requested also engages section 41(1)(b) of the FOIA as its release would be likely to constitute 
a breach of confidence. 

 
Section 41 is a qualified exemption. This means that in order to withhold information under this exemption, we 
must consider the public interest in disclosure. 
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Arguments in favour of disclosure 

• Homes England is compliant with the government agenda of transparency and recognises the benefit of 
publishing the information, particularly when it concerns how Homes England undertakes its work. 

 
Arguments in favour of withholding 

• Homes England believes that it should not disclose the information held as to do would constitute as a 
breach of confidence as the report was commissioned via one of our procurement frameworks and 
produced by a third party. To release the information would be in breach of the confidentially clauses 
contained within the framework. To disclose the information held would set a detrimental precedent and 
would prejudice the trust between Homes England and partners on our frameworks. 

 
After careful consideration we have concluded that at this time, the balance of the public interest favours the 
non-disclosure of the report in its entirety. 

 
The full text of the legislation can be found on the following link: 
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/section/41 

 
Advice and Assistance 
We have a duty to provide advice and assistance in accordance with Section 16 of the FOIA. As such, we can advise 

that although the Project Review Report itself cannot be released for the reasons detailed above, we have reviewed 

the content in so far as it applies to the context and justifications of your request. Therefore we can confirm that the 

only reference in the report to freeholds is the receipt amount received in relation to the freehold sales. Regarding 

any ecological scheme objectives agreed or reached, the report does not address these matters. The report was 

procured as an independent check/validation only that the accounts provided by the developer were accurate: 

“Review and comment on end of project appraisal and accounts produced by the Developer for determination of Overage 
including commentary on the accuracy and completeness of total project costs comprising construction, professional fees and 
impact of phasing, as prepared by the developer.” 

 

3) Complete unredacted copies of the minutes of any meetings, and/or any agreement reached, held with the 

Homes England, and/or its predecessor agency, and Morris Homes, relating to the property development 

scheme, transfer of property Freehold under the scheme and division of profits from the Vista Peterborough 

development scheme. 

We can confirm that we do not hold information that falls within the scope of this part of your request.  

To conclude that the information is not held, we have searched with our responsible project management team 
who would have the requested information if held. 
 
The FOIA does not oblige a public authority to create information to answer a request if the requested 
information is not held. The duty under section 1(1) is only to provide the recorded information held. 
 
The full text of section 1 in the legislation can be found here: 
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/section/1  
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Advice and Assistance 
We have a duty to provide advice and assistance in accordance with Section 16 of the FOIA. To comply with this 
duty we are able to confirm that we have reviewed all information held in relation to this development (minutes of 
all meetings, legal documents) and do not hold any information in relation to the Freehold/division of profits other 
than which is contained in the documents provided as Annex A, B & C.  
 
Peterborough City Council were responsible for the ‘Carbon Challenge’ scheme and therefore may hold information 
that may be relevant to you. You can submit a request to them via the following link: Freedom of Information - 
Peterborough City Council. 
 
Furthermore, although Morris Homes are not a public body bound by the Freedom of Information Act, they may 
choose to provide information to you on a voluntary basis and therefore you may wish to contact them for any 
further information they may hold.  
 
Discretionary Statement:  
We are also able (outside of the FOIA) to provide the following statement regarding the scheme:  
 
In order to support Morris Homes to incorporate various of the energy saving provisions and to allow them the 
ability to work with occupiers in support of these measures, Homes England permitted the disposal of houses 
through the grant of 999 year leases. Homes England usually ensures housing developers dispose of houses (as 
opposed to flats) through a freehold disposal to the occupier. However on this occasion the freehold of each house 
plot was transferred to Morris at the same time as the occupier was granted a 999 year lease. By granting a very 
long lease the scheme allowed for a balance between the need to enable the developer to implement the 
management and energy saving elements of this scheme with the need to ensure that the occupiers are put in the 
position that is more akin to that of a freeholder.  
 
The land disposal took place following a competitive bidding process which assessed both price and quality having 
regard to the particular aspirations for this to be an exemplary development with respect to energy usage. The site 
was advertised both in the UK property press and in the Official Journal of the European Union. Following this 
process the Morris Homes consortium were selected as the winning bidder. This process ensured that the best bid 
was selected as the winning bidder. This process ensured that the best bid was selected that reflected the specific 
extraordinary costs to develop the sire along with the anticipated receipts. The agreement includes a provision that 
ensures that at completion if the overall development profitability exceeds the anticipated then any surplus in net 
revenues would be shared between Homes England and the developer.  
 
Right to Appeal 
 
If you are not happy with the information that has been provided or the way in which your request has been 
handled, you may request an internal review. You can request an internal review by writing to Homes England via 
the details below, quoting the reference number at the top of this letter. 
 
Email: infogov@homesengland.gov.uk 
 
The Information Governance Team 
Homes England – 6th Floor 
Windsor House 
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50 Victoria Street 
London 
SW1H 0TL 
 
Your request for review must be made in writing, explain why you wish to appeal, and be received within 40 working 
days of the date of this response. Failure to meet this criteria may lead to your request being refused. 
 
Upon receipt, your request for review will be passed to an independent party not involved in your original request. 
We aim to issue a response within 20 working days. 
 
You may also complain to the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) however, the Information Commissioner 
does usually expect the internal review procedure to be exhausted in the first instance. 
 
The Information Commissioner's details can be found via the following link: 
 
https://ico.org.uk/ 
 
Please note that the contents of your request and this response are also subject to the Freedom of Information Act 
2000.  Homes England may be required to disclose your request and our response accordingly. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
The Information Governance Team 
For Homes England 
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