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          Windsor House 

By Email Only          Homes England – 6th Floor 
           50 Victoria Street 

London 
SW1H 0TL 

 
 
Dear  
 
RE: Request for Information – RFI3175 
 
Thank you for your request for information which we have processed in accordance with the under the 
Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR). 
 
You requested the following information:  
 
1. Can you please provide a copy of the 1954 conveyance for the property, known as Kinderhaven, at Gardiners 

Close, Basildon, Essex that comprises title number EX38760. 
 
2. Can you please provide a copy of the conveyance for the property known as Dunroamin (also called Gordon 

Lodge previously), purchased for the build of Cranes Farm Road possibly purchased sometime in the 
1950’s/1960’s, and part of the land included within title EX741832. 

 
Response 
 
Homes England does not hold copies of conveyances dated 1954 (Title EX38760) or 1950’s/ 1960’s (Title EX741832).  
 
In order to conclude that the information is not held, we have searched with our Records team who would have 
been able to locate the information if it were held. 
 
In accordance with Regulation 12(4)(a) a public authority may refuse a request to the extent that a public authority is 
not required to disclose information that it does not hold at the time the request is made. 
 
The full text of Regulation 12(4)(a) can be found here: 
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2004/3391/regulation/12/made 
 
We have reviewed the official titles for both EX38760 and EX741832 and have carried out searches and we can 
inform you that there are two conveyances detailed within the official titles, these are listed below for ease; 
 
1) A Conveyance dated 25 June 1898 for Title EX38760 
2) A Conveyance dated 18 May 1985 for Title EX741832  
 
Furthermore, we can confirm that Homes England does hold a copy of the conveyance dated 25 June 1898, for 
assistance and as a discretionary disclosure this conveyance is enclosed to this response and labelled Annex A. 
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Right to Appeal 
 
If you are not happy with the information that has been provided or the way in which your request has been handled 
you may request an internal review by writing to; 
 
The Information Governance Team 
Homes England – 6th Floor 
Windsor House 
50 Victoria Street 
London 
SW1H 0TL 
 
Or by email to infogov@homesengland.gov.uk  
 
You may also complain to the Information Commissioner however, the Information Commissioner does usually 
expect the internal review procedure to be exhausted in the first instance.  
 
The Information Commissioner's details can be found via the following link; 
https://ico.org.uk/ 
 
Please be aware, Homes England has the right to refuse requests which are deemed to be vexatious, for example a 
request that is identical or similar from another request received from someone that appears to be acting together, 
in accordance with Regulation 12(4)(b) of the EIR. Under this Regulation we may also refuse to comply with a 
request that would be too burdensome to deal with, we are able to aggregate requests from the same person, or 
from different people who appear to be acting together. 
 
Further guidance can be found on the ICO website (see the link above). 
 
Please note that the contents of your request and this response are also subject to the Freedom of Information Act 
2000 and Environmental Information Regulations 2004.  Homes England may be required to disclose your request 
and our response accordingly. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
The Information Governance Team 
For Homes England 
 

 

 

 


















