Date: 19/06/19
Our Ref: RFI2698

Your Ref: FOI Request — Awarded Tenders HomeS

Tel: 0300 1234 500

Email: foi@homesengland.gov.uk England

Windsor House

By Email Only Homes England — 6" Floor
50 Victoria Street
London
SW1H OTL

RE: Request for Information — RFI2698

Thank you for your request for information, which was processed under the Freedom of Information Act 2000
(FOIA).

For clarification, you requested the following information:

I am trying to ascertain whether or not the contracts below have been awarded yet and if so, are you able to tell me
who to?

1. Walkmill Lane, Cannock, 116 dwellings. Includes access road. Former Parker Hannafin site, Submission date
05/10/2018

2. Land of Rudgate Park, Thorp Arch, Wetherby, Phase 2 - 119nr New Houses, Submission date 08/02/2019

3. Former Colt International, New Lane, Havant, Construction of up to 100 new homes, Submission date
01/03/2019

4. Land of Rushenden Road, Queenborough, Enabling & Remediation Works to a former mill site, Submission
date 05/04/2019

Response

We can confirm that we do hold some recorded information that falls within the scope of your request we will
therefore address each of points in turn below.

1) Walkmill Lane, Cannock — The contract has been awarded to Galliford Try Partnerships LTD.

2) Land at Rudgate Park — We can confirm that we do not hold recorded information that falls within the scope
of your request. To clarify, the Agency has not yet awarded the contract and so therefore we do not hold the
recorded information to provide a response to this part of your request.

Discretionary Disclosure

We can however inform you (outside of the FOIA) that the Agency has concluded the evaluation of the
procurement process and will be making a recommendation to an internal governance meeting in July. To
confirm, we have not formally awarded the contract but we have told the bidders informally whether they
are / are not being recommended as preferred bidder.

3) Former Colt International — The contract has been awarded to Galliford Try Partnerships LTD (subject to the
contract being signed by both parties).
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4) Land of Rushden Road - The contract has been awarded to Cognition Land and Water Limited.

Right to Appeal

If you are not happy with the information that has been provided or the way in which your request has been handled
you may request an internal review by writing to;

The Information Access Team
Homes England — 6" Floor
Windsor House

50 Victoria Street

London

SW1H OTL

Or by email to foi@homesengland.gov.uk

You may also complain to the Information Commissioner however, the Information Commissioner does usually
expect the internal review procedure to be exhausted in the first instance.

The Information Commissioner's details can be found via the following link

https://ico.org.uk/

Please note that the contents of your request and this response are also subject to the Freedom of Information Act
2000. Homes England may be required to disclose your request and our response accordingly.

Yours sincerely,

Information Access Team
For Homes England
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