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       9 April 2019 

Dear ''''''' ''''''''''''''' 
 
Thank you for your e-mail of 19 March requesting the following information: 
 

1.    The promotion criteria for promotion from Sgt to SSgt in the QGS. 
2.    The promotion criteria for promotion from SSgt to WO2 in the QGS. 

3.    The number of QGS Sgts eligible for selection for promotion to SSgt in the years     
2011 to 2018 and the number selected.   

 

I am treating your correspondence as a request for information under the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 (FOIA). The information you have requested is shown at Annex A. 
 
If you have any queries regarding the content of this letter, please contact this office in the 
first instance. 
 
If you wish to complain about the handling of your request, or the content of this response, 
you can request an independent internal review by contacting the Information Rights 
Compliance team, Ground Floor, MOD Main Building, Whitehall, SW1A 2HB (e-mail CIO-
FOI-IR@mod.uk).  Please note that any request for an internal review should be made 
within 40 working days of the date of this response.  
 
If you remain dissatisfied following an internal review, you may raise your complaint 
directly to the Information Commissioner under the provisions of Section 50 of the 
Freedom of Information Act.  Please note that the Information Commissioner will not 
normally investigate your case until the MOD internal review process has been completed.  
The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, 
Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF.  Further details of the role 
and powers of the Information Commissioner can be found on the Commissioner's website 
at https://ico.org.uk/. 
 
 
 
 
 



Yours sincerely 
 
 
 
'''''''''''''' ''''''''''' ''''''''''''''''''''''''



ANNEX A 
 

Queen’s Gurkha Signals 
 
1. The promotion criteria for promotion from Sgt to SSgt in the QGS. 
 
The promotion criteria in QG Signals is the same as that for the R SIGNALS generally. The 
promotion criteria in the policy is to have a minimum of 24 months (from seniority date) in 
substantive Sgt rank and 10 years of reckonable service before the first day of promotion year (1 
Apr – 31 Mar). The soldier must have a recommendation for promotion on the current SJAR. The 
policy is contained in R SIGNALS Policy Directive (PD) No 6, Ver 22. 

 
2. The promotion criteria for promotion from SSgt to WO2 in the QGS. 
 
The promotion criteria in QG Signals is the same as that for the R SIGNALS generally. The 
promotion criteria in the policy is to have a minimum of 24 months (from seniority date) in 
substantive SSgt rank and 16 years of reckonable service before the first day of promotion year (1 
Apr – 31 Mar).  The soldier must have a recommendation for promotion on the current SJAR. The 
policy is contained in R SIGNALS Policy Directive (PD) No 6, Ver 22. 
 
3. The number of QGS Sgts eligible for selection for promotion to SSgt in the years 2011 to 
2018 and the number selected.  
 
  

Year Eligible  Selected Remarks 

2011   Data Not Held 

2012   Data Not Held 

2013   Data Not Held 

2014 20 10  

2015 15 10  

2016 30 10  

2017 30 10  

2018 30 ~  

 
 

Rounding: The data have been rounded to the nearest 5 to limit disclosure and ensure confidentiality. 
Totals and sub-totals have been rounded separately and so may not appear to be the sum of their parts. 

 
“~” fewer than 5. 
“-” denotes zero 




