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	March 2019


Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) Request – 190225039
Thank you for your email and letter received on 25 February 2019 in which you made a request for the following information from the Ministry of Justice (MoJ):  
Request for Information pursuant to the Freedom of Information Act 2000
I understand that HMP Bradford is subject to the above legislation. Please accept this letter as my request to provide the following information namely:

1. Statistics which confirms suicide rates of prison officers in the UK

2. Statistics of successful/unsuccessful suicide attempts for prison officers in the UK.

3. Statistics of prison officers that are on long term sick leave with stress/anxiety/depression.

4. Statistics of prison officers in the UK with other mental health issues. 
Your letter has been handled as a request under FOIA. 
In relation to England and Wales, I can confirm MoJ holds the information you requested for prison officers who are on long term sick as requested at questions 3 and 4 and I have provided in text below:
As at 31st December 2018, there were 145 prison officers1 in England and Wales who were on long term sick2 due to stress, anxiety or depression.
Also in the 12 months to 31 December 2018, the number of prison officers1 in England and Wales who had taken sick leave due to other mental health issues3 was 196.
Data notes:
1Prison officers include Band 3-4/Prison Officer (incl specialists), Band 4/Supervising Officer and Band 5/Custodial Managers. 

2 Long term sick is defined as absence of over 28 days

3 Only includes staff with mental health issues other than those attributed to anxiety or depression, and with at least one day sick i.e. includes individuals both on long term and short term sick.

You may wish to know that information on working days lost due to sickness are published in the HMPPS workforce statistics quarterly bulletin. In particular, figures on reason for sickness, such as Mental and Behavioural Disorders, are published in Table 16 of the accompanying Excel tables. The latest edition of this bulletin can be found below: https://www.gov.uk/government/statistics/hm-prison-and-probation-service-workforce-quarterly-december-2018
Still in relation to England and Wales, I can confirm that MoJ does not hold any statistics in respect of prison officer suicides i.e. questions 1 and 2 as there may be multiple reasons for suicide which may be unrelated to an officer’s occupation. 

Please be informed that the FOIA does not oblige a public authority to create information to answer a request if the requested information is not held. The duty is to only provide the recorded information held.
On a discretionary basis however and outside of the FOIA, we can advise that the Office for National Statistics (ONS) publish information on suicides by occupation at the link below: https://www.ons.gov.uk/peoplepopulationandcommunity/birthsdeathsandmarriages/deaths/datasets/suicidebyoccupationenglandagespecificcounts
Should you wish to re-direct this part of your request to the ONS, I have also provided you below the contact for their FOI team: 


Office for National Statistics
FOI team, Room 1100
Segensworth Road, Titchfield, Fareham, Hampshire, PO15 5RR
Email: foi.team@ons.gov.uk
Please be advised that information in relation to prisons in Scotland and Northern Ireland are matters for the Scottish Government and Northern Ireland Executive respectively. You may wish to contact them directly as follows: 
Scottish Prison Service Headquarters 
Communications Branch, Room 338 Calton House, 5 Redheughs Rigg, Edinburgh, EH12 9HW. Email: gaolinfo@sps.pnn.gov.uk 
Northern Ireland Prison Service 
Records & Information Management Team, Upper Newtownards Road, Dundonald House, Belfast, BT4 3SU. Email: nipsfoi@dojni.x.gsi.gov.uk
Her Majesty’s Prison & Probation Service (HMPPS) is committed to ensuring the health, safety and wellbeing of its staff, with all staff having access to a comprehensive occupational health service and employee assistance programme.
