
  

  

 
 
              October 2017 
 
 
 
 
 
REFERENCE:  17FOI 102 
 
You requested the following information: 
 
 
Individuals have a right, commonly referred to as a subject access request (SAR), created by 
section 7 of the Data Protection Act. I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 
2000 to request the following information regarding your processing of subject access requests: 
 
1. How many subject access requests did you receive the identifying paperwork for and process 
in 2014? 
2. How many subject access requests did you receive the identifying paperwork for and process 
in 2015? 
3. How many subject access requests did you receive the identifying paperwork for and process 
in 2016? 
4. How many subject access requests you rejected in 2014? 
5. How many subject access requests you rejected in 2015? 
6. How many subject access requests you rejected in 2016? 
7. What was the average cost for you to process a subject access request in 2014? 
8. What was the average cost for you to process a subject access request in 2015? 
9. What was the average cost for you to process a subject access request in 2016? 
10. How much do you charge an individual to process a subject access request? 
 
 
 
We have handled your request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
 
 
 

 
A1. None 
 
A2. One 
 
A3. None 
 
A4. None 
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A5. None 
 
A6. None 
 
A7. Not applicable 
 
A8. The Wales Office does not hold this information. 
 
A9. Not Applicable 
 
A10.    The Wales Office does not hold this information since it is not an employer in its own 
right. Subject access requests are submitted to the Ministry of Justice who employ staff on our 
behalf. You may therefore wish to seek this information from that department. 
 
 
 

 
 

 


