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REF: FOI2016/09249, 09250 and 09251    27 October 2016 
 

 

Dear xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx,  
 
Thank you for your emails of 6th September 2016 requesting the following information:  
 

1) Please provide details of expenditure on software for the years 2014/15 and 2015/16 broken 
down by software supplier.  
 

2) Please provide details of software contracts due to expire before 31st December 2017, 
broken down by supplier and date.  
 

3) Please provide details of expenditure on perpetual software licences for the years 2014/15 
and 2015/16 broken down by software supplier.  

 
I am treating your correspondence as a request for information under the Freedom of Information 
Act 2000 (FOIA).  
 
A search for the information has now been completed within the UK Hydrographic Office, and I can 
confirm that some information in scope of your request is held. 
 
Our response to your request is therefore as follows: 
 

1)   The information is not held in the format requested. 
 

2) This has been provided in Annex A of this letter. 
 

3) The information is not held in the format requested. 
 
The full breakdown for the information you asked for is not possible as it is not held by the UKHO in 
the level of detail you have requested. We have supplied the information we do hold within the 
scope of the request. 
 
If you are not satisfied with this response or you wish to complain about any aspect of the handling 
of your request, then you should contact me in the first instance. If informal resolution is not possible 
and you are still dissatisfied then you may apply for an independent internal review by contacting 
the Information Rights Compliance team, 1st Floor, MOD Main Building, Whitehall, SW1A 2HB (e-
mail DDC-FOI-Publishing@mod.uk). Please note that any request for an internal review must be 
made within 40 working days of the date on which the attempt to reach informal resolution has come 
to an end.  
 
 

mailto:DDC-FOI-Publishing@mod.uk


If you remain dissatisfied following an internal review, you may take your complaint to the 
Information Commissioner under the provisions of Section 50 of the Freedom of Information Act. 
Please note that the Information Commissioner will not investigate your case until the MOD internal 
review process has been completed. Further details of the role and powers of the Information 
Commissioner can be found on the Commissioner's website, http://www.ico.org.uk. 
 
 
 
Yours sincerely, 

 
UKHO Secretariat 
 

http://www.ico.org.uk/


Valid to Agreement type Name

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Netscaler VPX200 Virtual Appliance Software

Q3 16/17 Software agreement AutoCAD LT 2015

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Ingres Software Support and Subscription

Q3 16/17 Software agreement BrowseAloud

Q3 16/17 Software agreement AppZero Enterprise License

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Geocable Database

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Citrix Support and Maintenance

Q3 16/17 Software agreement ADXstudio Portals Enterprise

Q3 16/17 Software agreement PDFView4NET

Q3 16/17 Software agreement iText

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Esri EDN Subscriptions

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Acroplot Pro Support and Maintenance

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Blackpearl Support and Maintenance (HDB)

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Pix Edit

Q3 16/17 Software agreement RSA Auth Manager Licenses

Q3 16/17 Software agreement SevenC's Software Support and Maintenance

Q3 16/17 Software agreement TNT MIPS Maintenance

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Netc Barcode Label Printing System

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Fledermaus Software

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Dkart Support and Maintenance (IC-ENC)

Q3 16/17 Software agreement CARIS Software Support and Subscription

Q3 16/17 Software agreement TRIM

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Dkart Support and Maintenance (UKHO)

Q3 16/17 Software agreement SevenC's Software Support and Maintenance

Q3 16/17 Software agreement Symantec Mailsecurity / Endpoint

Q3 16/17 Software agreement TNT MIPS Maintenance

Q3 16/17 Software agreement SevenC's Software Support and Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement ARCs to Geotiff

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Redhat Linux

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Golden Surfer Support and Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Crystal Reports (Defence)

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Sql Sentry Support and Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement SNAP Plus

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Archive Camera Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Intel Parallel Studio XE Support

Q4 16/17 Software agreement ET Geowizard and Geobox Support

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Veeam Backup and Replicate

Q4 16/17 Software agreement SPCAF Pro Subscription

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Miramo Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Erdas Imagine Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement IPS1 Support

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Dotfuscator Pro Support and Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Caris - Inspire SFE

Q4 16/17 Software agreement ESRI Support and Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement TextConverter Pro and Redistributable License

Q4 16/17 Software agreement InstallShield Pro Support and Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Achilles Themis Subscription

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Qtax Pro Subscription

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Invoices and Ebydos Support and Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Blue Marble Support and Maintenace

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Boldon James - RLI

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Microsoft Premier Support

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Citrix Support and Maintenance

Q4 16/17 Software agreement Microsoft ESA 2016-19

Q4 16/17 Software agreement POSPac Support and Maintenance

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Hadoop - Cloudera

Q1 17/18 Software agreement DevCraft Support

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Zerto Support and Maintenance

Q1 17/18 Software agreement DMarGS Support and Maintenance

Q1 17/18 Software agreement JEGS Framework

Q1 17/18 Software agreement ESRI Support and Maintenance

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Enterprise Code Signing Cert Windows Phone

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Slack UKHO Mobile

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Mac In Cloud

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Sketch 3 (Bohemian)

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Xamarin Test Cloud

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Reflector 2 Air Squirrels

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Shiraz Maintenance

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Matlab Support and Maintenance

Q1 17/18 Software agreement XML Spy Pro

Q1 17/18 Software agreement ET Geowizards (Vidal)

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Exceed and NFS Client Support and Maintenance

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Terrago Publisher ArcGis

Q1 17/18 Software agreement EPI-USE Data Sync Manager

Q1 17/18 Software agreement GS1 Membership

Q1 17/18 Software agreement ProGet Enterprise Annual Subscription

Q1 17/18 Software agreement SAMS System Support

Q1 17/18 Software agreement Key Manager Support

Q2 17/18 Software agreement Nessus Vulnrability Scanner

Q2 17/18 Software agreement SAFE FME Support and Maintenance

Q2 17/18 Software agreement Password Manager Pro Enterprise Support

Q2 17/18 Software agreement WinZip Support

Q2 17/18 Software agreement Checkpoint Firewall Support and Maintenance

Q2 17/18 Software agreement SNOW License Manager

Q2 17/18 Software agreement Solarwinds Maintenance

Q2 17/18 Software agreement Quicksilver Support and Maintenance

Q3 17/18 Software agreement Password Manager Pro VIDAL Manage Engine MASTER

Q3 17/18 Software agreement CorelDraw Support and Maintenance

Q3 17/18 Software agreement SAFE FME Support and Maintenance

Q3 17/18 Software agreement Fujifilm XMF Service Support  


