



# CIVIL NUCLEAR CONSTABULARY

[REDACTED]

**Email:** [REDACTED]

**Our Ref:** 2015-065

**The Executive Office**

Civil Nuclear Constabulary  
Building F6 Culham Science Centre  
Abingdon  
Oxon  
OX14 3DB

Tel: 01235 466428

Website: <https://www.gov.uk/government/organisations/civil-nuclear-constabulary>

Dear [REDACTED]

I am writing in response to your request for information regarding the below received on 30 June 2015. Your request has been handled under Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with Section 1(1)(a) of the Act I hereby confirm that the CNC/CNPA does hold information of the type specified.

a) How many police cars have collided with pedestrians in 2015 so far? In each case, please detail the date of the crash, the speed of the police car at the time, was it responding to an emergency, the location of the incident, the extent of the person or persons' injuries and what, if any, was the penalty for the police driver. Please also detail the age and gender of the pedestrian.

2015 – 0

2014 – 0

2013 – 0

b) How many police cars have collided with animals in 2015 so far? In each case, please detail the date of the crash, the speed of the police car at the time, the location of the incident, was it responding to an emergency, what the animal was, the extent of the animals' injuries and what, if any, was the penalty for the police driver.

2015 – 0

2014 – 0

2013 – 0

c) How many police cars have been involved in crashes with other cars this year? In each case, please detail the date of the crash, the speed of the police car at the time, the location of the incident, make and model of the other car, any injuries sustained by any parties, what the damage was to the two vehicles, and what, if any, was the penalty for the police driver.

Please note we do not hold the following information

- the speed of the police car at the time
- any injuries sustained by any parties

LOCATION	ACC DATE	DUTY TYPE	ACC TYPE 1	ACC TYPE 2	POL DAMAGE	TP VEHICLE
THORNBURY KINGSTON LANE	04/05/2013	Other	Narrow Road Passing	PV Clips Wing Mirror	O/S MIRROR	FORD TRANSIT
DUNGENESS CAR PARK B	29/01/2014	Parking / Unattended	Reversing	PV Hits STAT Vehicle	R/O/S BUMPER - SCUFF	MERCEDES VITO
DRIGG SHORE ROAD	03/05/2014	General Patrol	Narrow Road Passing	PV Clips Wing Mirror	O/S MIRROR	FORD TRANSIT
SURREY A322	09/10/2014	Other	Junction Accident	PV Hit at Rear by TP	R/N/S	FORD TRANSIT
SELLAFIELD NR MAIN GATES	03/12/2014	Parking / Unattended	OTHER	PV Hit from Side	R/O/S	DAF EON
PIRBRIGHT B3405 GRANGE ROAD	06/01/2015	Other	OTHER	PV Clips Wing Mirror	O/S MIRROR	Not recorded
ASCOT SUNNINGDALE PARK HOTEL	12/03/2015	Other	PV Factor NonPursuit	PV Hits STAT Vehicle	R/O/S WING - DENT	BMW X1

We take our responsibilities under the Freedom of Information Act seriously but, if you feel your request has not been properly handled or you are otherwise dissatisfied with the outcome of your request, you have the right to complain. We will investigate the matter and endeavour to reply within 3 – 6 weeks. You should write in the first instance to:

Sarah Shevlin  
Disclosures Officer  
CNC  
Culham Science Centre  
Abingdon  
Oxfordshire  
OX14 3DB

E-mail: [FOI@cnc.pnn.police.uk](mailto:FOI@cnc.pnn.police.uk)

If you are still dissatisfied following our internal review, you have the right, under section 50 of the Act, to complain directly to the Information Commissioner. Before considering your complaint, the Information Commissioner would normally expect you to have exhausted the complaints procedures provided by the CNPA.

The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:

FOI Compliance Team (complaints)  
Wycliffe House  
Water Lane  
Wilmslow  
Cheshire  
SK9 5AF

If you require any further assistance in connection with this request please contact us at our address below:

Sarah Shevlin  
Disclosures Officer  
CNC  
Culham Science Centre  
Abingdon  
Oxfordshire  
OX14 3DB

E-mail: [FOI@cnc.pnn.police.uk](mailto:FOI@cnc.pnn.police.uk)

Yours sincerely

Sarah Shevlin  
Disclosures Officer  
Civil Nuclear Constabulary