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	Our Reference: FOI/91946
	

	December 2014


Freedom of Information Request 

You asked for the following information from the Ministry of Justice (MoJ):

What was the highest number of previous convictions for burglary held by an individual convicted of that offence without being sent to prison in 2013 and how many offences had they committed in total at the point of sentence for this offence? 

What was the highest number of previous convictions for drug offences held by an individual convicted of drug offences without being sent to prison in 2013 and how many offences had they committed in total at the point of sentence for this offence? 

What was the highest number of previous convictions for taking a vehicle held by an individual convicted of an offence of taking a vehicle without being sent to prison in 2013 and how many offences had they committed in total at the point of sentence for this offence? 

What was the highest number of previous convictions for sexual assault held by an individual convicted of an offence of sexual assault without being sent to prison in 2013 and how many offences had they committed in total at the point of sentence for this offence? 

What was the highest number of previous convictions for breach of anti-social behavioural orders held by an individual convicted of an offence of breach of anti-social behavioural order without being sent to prison in 2013 and how many offences had they committed in total at the point of sentence for this offence? 

What was the highest number of previous convictions for robbery held by an individual convicted of an offence of robbery without being sent to prison in 2013 and how many offences had they committed in total at the point of sentence for this offence? 

What was the highest number of previous convictions for failing to comply with a sex offenders register held by an individual convicted of an offence of failing to comply with a sex offenders register without being sent to prison in 2013 and how many offences had they committed in total at the point of sentence for this offence? 

What was the highest number of previous convictions for taking indecent photographs of children held by an individual convicted of an offence of taking indecent photographs of children without being sent to prison in 2013 and how many offences had they committed in total at the point of sentence for this offence? 

NOTE:  My use of the word convictions means occasions where the individual has pleaded guilty or been found guilty in a court when I use the word offence I mean convictions in court AND cautions.  Could the answer to Q.1 to Q.8 be provided to me in a table similar to that provided to me in a previous FOI requests (Ref: FOI /77313)

 9.      Of all the individuals who were sentenced at court in 2013 please answer the following questions in relation to the individual who received a sentence that was other than immediate custody and had the most previous convictions.  (i) How many convictions did he/she have? (ii) What was the year they were first convicted? (iii) How many times have they been given custodial sentences? (iv) How many times did they receive non-custodial sentences?  Please provide me with a table showing his/her previous convictions broken down by type of offence in a similar fashion to that provided to me in a similar request (Ref:  FOI/771419). In relation to that individual could you please provide me with the main offences he/she was sentenced for on this final occasion in 2013 when they were not sent to jail?

Your request has been passed to me as I have responsibility for answering requests which relate to statistics on offenders in England and Wales and has been handled under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA).
I can confirm that the MoJ holds the data that you have requested and I am pleased to provide the majority of this to you below. Some of the information that you have requested is covered by an exemption in the FOIA, which means that it cannot be provided to you. I have explained this in further detail at the relevant point in the response.

Questions 1 to 8

Table 1 presents statistics on the highest number of previous convictions for offenders convicted of the same selected offences without being sentenced to immediate custody for their most recent conviction and the total number of previous convictions for any offence committed prior to their most recent sentence in England and Wales, 2013. It should be noted that although these offenders did not receive an immediate custodial sentence at the most recent occasion they may have previously been sentenced to immediate custody.
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Highest number of previous 

convictions
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 for the same offence

Number of offenders with highest 

number of previous convictions for 

the same offence

Number of previous 

cautions/convictions for 

any offence

 2

Burglary Offences 39 1 (55)

Drug Offences 29 1 (55)

Offence involving taking a vehicle

5

11 1 (38)

Sexual assault

6

5 1 (5)

Breach of an anti social behaviourial order 119 1 (338)

Robbery 7 2

(30, 26)

3

Failure to comply with Notification Order - Sexual 

Offences Act 2003

7

10 1 (159)

Taking indecent photographs of children 3 1 (4)

Source:

Notes

:

6. Sexual assault offences exclude rape cases

7. Includes offence: Notifying Police, under Notification Order, with false information - Sexual Offences Act 2003 S.91  (1)(b) & (2)

5. Offences involving taking a vehicle include (Theft Act 1968 S.12 (1) as amended by Criminal Justice Act 1988 S.37 Unauthorised taking of a motor vehicle 

and Taking motor vehicle without consent of owner (1963) [standard list 1963] )

4. All data have been taken from the MoJ extract of the Police National Computer. This includes details of all convictions, cautions, reprimands or warnings 

given for recordable offences (see www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2000/1139/schedule/made for definition). It is therefore possible that some offenders presented in 

this table have previously also received convictions for offences not recorded on the PNC.

Table 1: Highest number of previous convictions

1

 for selected offences of the same type and number of previous caution and convictions for any 

offence for offenders who were not sent to prison for their most recent conviction. England and Wales, 2013

3.  In cases where more than one offender had the highest number of previous convictions, each offender's total number of previous offences are given

1. Figures are based on counting the number of occasions on which offenders have previously received a conviction for the same offence (primary offence), 

recorded on the Police National Computer, including some offences committed outside of England and Wales. 

2.  Figures are based on counting the number of occasions on which offenders have previously received a caution or conviction for any offence (primary 

offence), recorded on the Police National Computer, including some offences committed outside of England and Wales. 

Ministry of Justice, Police National Computer (PNC)


Question 9.

The offender with the most previous convictions of those offenders who were sentenced to a non custodial sentence in 2013 had a total of 487 previous convictions. This offender had received the immediate custody sentence previously for other offences. Table 2 provides a full breakdown of these offences as set out in the question. 
In response to your enquiries about the year in which this individual was first convicted, and the final offence for which they were convicted, I can confirm that the department holds information that you have asked for, but in this case we will not be providing it to you as it is exempt from disclosure. 

We are not obliged, under section 40(2) of the Act, to provide information that is the personal information of another person if releasing would contravene any of the provisions in the Data Protection Act 1998 (DPA). In this instance we believe that the release of this information would contravene the first data protection principle and therefore section 40 (2) is engaged. To release this information, would be to risk identification of the person to whom it relates. This is because it may be possible to ‘link’ it with other information already available (in the wider public domain or to certain individuals) in order to create a wider ‘map’ of information. This is known as the’Jigsaw Effect.’
The terms of this exemption in the Freedom of Information Act mean that we do not have to consider whether or not it would be in the public interest for you to have the information.

You can find out more about Section 40(2) by reading the extract from the Act and some guidance points we consider when applying the exemption, attached at the end of this letter.
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Sentences other 

than immediate 

custody

Drunk and disorderly 394 17 377

Public disorder 1 0 1

Breach of Anti Social Behaviour order and breach of bail

20 2 18

Criminal damage 5 0 5

Assault 6 2 4

Burglary, robbery, blackmail 1 0 1

Weapon possession offences 1 1 0

Harassment 56 3 53

GBH 1 0 1

Other 2 0 2

Total 487 25 462

Source:

Ministry of Justice, Police National Computer (PNC)

Notes

:

Table 2: Among offenders receiving non-custodial sentences in 2013, the offender who had the most 

previous

1

 convictions broken down by offence type and disposal type

2

3. Data have been taken from the MoJ extract of the Police National Computer. This includes details of all convictions, 

cautions, reprimands or warnings given for recordable offences (see 

www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2000/1139/schedule/made for definition). It is therefore possible that some offenders 

presented in this table have previously also received convictions for offences not recorded on the PNC.

Offence Type

Sentencing 

occasions

1

Disposal type

2 Figures are based on separate sentencing occasions; where the offender was sentenced on the same occasion for 

several offences it is the details of the primary offence that have been presented.

1. Figures are based on counting the number of occasions on which offenders have previously received a 

conviction for any offence (primary offence), recorded on the Police National Computer, including some 

offences committed outside of England and Wales. 


The figures provided have been drawn from an extract of the Police National Computer (PNC) data held by the Department. The PNC holds details of all convictions and cautions given for recordable offences and include a number of offences where it is not possible for offenders to be given a custodial sentence. As with any large scale recording system the PNC is subject to possible errors with data entry and processing so data provided may be subject to revision.

You can also find more information by reading the full text of the Act (available at http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/contents) and further guidance http://www.justice.gov.uk/guidance/freedom-of-information.htm. 
Outside of the Act, I am pleased to provide you with the following discretionary information which I hope you will find useful.

Whilst crime is falling, sentences are getting more severe. Since 2010, fewer individuals are entering the criminal justice system for the first time but those who do offend are more likely to go to prison, and for longer. But we have a persistent hardcore of offenders being recycled round and round the criminal justice system, as these figures suggest.

This Government is committed to tackling re-offending rates. We have reformed sentences, so that they combine both punishment and requirements that are effective at preventing further offending. 
We have legislated so that all community orders must now have a punitive element, and, from 2015, every offender leaving prison spends at least 12 months under supervision, where currently around 50,000 are released each year with no statutory support. We are transforming rehabilitation, by bringing together the best of the public, private and voluntary sectors, and only rewarding them when they actually do reduce re-offending.

Sentencing in individual cases is a matter for our independent judiciary, taking account of the circumstances of the case and the maximum penalty for the offence. A court may only impose a community order or a custodial sentence where the offence is imprisonable. 
EXPLANATION OF FOIA - SECTION 40(2) – INFORMATION RELATING TO THIRD PARTIES
We have provided below additional information about Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act. We have included some extracts from the legislation, as well as some of the guidance we use when applying it. We hope you find this information useful.

The legislation

Section 1: Right of Access to information held by public authorities

(1) Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 

(a)
to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the description specified in the request, and 

(b) 
if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him. 

Section 40: Personal Information.
(1) Any information to which a request for information relates is exempt information if it constitutes personal data of which the applicant is the data subject.
(2) Any information to which a request for information relates is also exempt information if—
(a)
it constitutes personal data which do not fall within subsection (1), and
(b)
either the first or the second condition below is satisfied.
(3) The first condition is—
(a)
in a case where the information falls within any of paragraphs (a) to (d) of the definition of “data” in section 1(1) of the Data Protection Act 1998, that the disclosure of the information to a member of the public otherwise than under this Act would contravene—
(i)
any of the data protection principles, or
(ii)
section 10 of that Act (right to prevent processing likely to cause  damage or distress), and
(b)
in any other case, that the disclosure of the information to a member of the public otherwise than under this Act would contravene any of the data protection principles if the exemptions in section 33A(1) of the Data Protection Act 1998 (which relate to manual data held by public authorities) were disregarded.
Guidance

Section 40 of the Freedom of Information Act applies to: 

· requests for the personal data of the applicant him or herself 
· requests for the personal data of someone else (a third party) 

Personal data of a third party: Personal data of a third party is exempt under section 40(2) if its disclosure to a member of the public would contravene one or more of the data protection principles and a request must be refused.

The Data Protection Principles: 
The data protection principles are a statutory code for the processing of personal data. They are set out in Part I of Schedule 1 to the Data Protection Act.
Three data protection principles require personal data to be: 

· fairly and lawfully processed 

· processed for specified and lawful purposes 

· adequate, relevant and not excessive 

· accurate, and kept up to date 

· not kept longer than necessary 

· processed in accordance with individuals' rights under the Data Protection Act 

· kept secure 

· not transferred to non-EEA (European Economic Area) countries without  adequate protection 

The principle most likely to be relevant to the disclosure of information under the Freedom of Information Act is the first principle. This requires personal information to be: 

· processed ‘fairly’ 

· processed ‘lawfully’ 

· not processed at all unless one of the ‘conditions’ for fair processing is met 

Processing in this context includes disclosure.

In most cases, personal data will be exempt if disclosure would be ‘unfair’. Disclosure of personal data relating to a third party will often breach the fair processing principle if there was a legitimate expectation by a third party that this information would remain confidential.
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