	   [image: image1.png]g .& 2
JE)
<

Ministry
of Justice





	
	

	
	
	
	

	
	Our Reference: 89368
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Freedom of Information Request 
You asked for the following information from the Ministry of Justice (MoJ):

“This letter is a request for information relating to the whereabouts of:

1. Information on the whereabouts of prisoners from Wales across England and Wales as of 31st March 2014. 

2. Information on the whereabouts of prisoners from Greater Manchester across England and Wales as of 31st March 2014. 

3. Information on the whereabouts of prisoners from Merseyside across England and Wales as of 31st March 2014.

 4. Information on the whereabouts of prisoners from South Yorkshire across England and Wales as of 31st March 2014. 

5. Information on the whereabouts of prisoners from Tyne and Wear across England and Wales as of 31st March 2014. 

6. Information on the whereabouts of prisoners from West Midlands across England and Wales as of 31st March 2014. 

7. Information on the whereabouts of prisoners from West Yorkshire across England and Wales as of 31st March 2014. 

8. Information on the whereabouts of prisoners from Greater London across England and Wales as of 31st March 2014”

Your request has been handled under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA).

I can confirm that the Ministry of Justice (MoJ) does not hold the information that you have requested at this time. Under the Act we are obligated to provide information that we hold outside of a number of exemptions within 20 working days.  
It may help if I clarify that the information being requested is not held by MoJ because the day of the requested data has yet to come i.e. 31/03/2014, hence I am unable to provide the data as there is no legal or business requirement for MoJ to do so at this time.
I would advise that in future you send your request for data that we may hold after it has happened rather than ask for data which has yet to occur, as you have done on this occasion.

Please be advised that the FOIA does not oblige a public authority to create information to answer a request if the requested information is not held. It does not place a duty upon public authorities to answer a question unless recorded information exists. The FOIA duty is to only provide the recorded information held. 

