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DECC and the new Government website 
 
Introduction 
On 23 January 2013 DECC’s website content moved to the new single website for Government 
www.gov.uk. The new homepage for DECC is now: www.gov.uk/decc, and the new homepage for 
DECC statistics is now: www.gov.uk/government/organisations/department-of-energy-climate-
change/about/statistics. By 2014, the websites of all government departments and many other 
public bodies will have moved to www.gov.uk, some have already moved, and others will follow 
over the next few months.  
 
Background 
The statistical content on the new website is exactly the same as before with each statistical series 
shown on the DECC statistics homepage. Some examples of the new statistical series web 
addresses that may be of interest to readers of Energy Trends include: 

Electricity statistics: 
www.gov.uk/government/organisations/department-of-energy-climate-change/series/electricity-
statistics 

Renewables statistics: 
www.gov.uk/government/organisations/department-of-energy-climate-change/series/renewables-
statistics 

Domestic Energy Price statistics: 
www.gov.uk/government/organisations/department-of-energy-climate-change/series/domestic-
energy-prices 
 
Energy Trends publications: 
www.gov.uk/government/organisations/department-of-energy-climate-change/series/energy-trends 

All web addresses from the old DECC website will automatically be redirected to the new website, 
so users do not need to change any links or bookmarks that they have set up. 
 
All current data and publications previously available on the old DECC website have been 
transferred to the new website; historic data and publications can however still be accessed via the 
National Archives website at:  
http://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/20130109092117/http://www.decc.gov.uk/en/content/cm
s/statistics/statistics.aspx 

The new website also hosts a search facility to enable users to find statistics and documents that 
DECC has published, available at:   
www.gov.uk/government/publications?departments%5B%5D=department-of-energy-climate-
change&publication_filter_option=statistics, which can be filtered by publication type, topic, 
government department and date. Published alongside the search facility is a live feed listing the 
latest statistics content published by DECC. 
 
User feedback 
We welcome all feedback from users, therefore if you have any comments or queries regarding the 
new website, please contact Kevin Harris using the contact details below. 
 
 
Kevin Harris 
Energy Statistics  
Tel: 0300 068 5041 
E-mail: Kevin.Harris@decc.gsi.gov.uk 
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