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Freedom of Information Request 
You asked for the following information from the Ministry of Justice (MoJ), in relation to Judicial Review Applications:

1.   Since October 2011 how many Judicial Review applications have been transferred from the administrative court to the Upper Tribunal? 

2.   How many of these Judicial Reviews requested that a decision be made with regards to removal directions? 

3.   How many of these Judicial Reviews contained a request to be considered as urgent? 

4.   How many of these Judicial Reviews were granted permission to proceed? 

5.   How many of these Judicial Reviews were refused permission to proceed? 

6.   How many of these Judicial Reviews were withdrawn by the claimant? 

7.   How many of these Judicial Reviews were withdrawn by the consent of both parties? 

8.   How many oral hearings were heard following Judicial Review applications? 

9.   How many cases were allowed following an oral hearing? 

10.  How many cases were refused following an oral hearing? 

11.  How many injunctions preventing removal of an individual were issued by the Upper Tribunal? 

12.  What was the total revenue received in court fees paid by claimants? 

13.  What was the total revenue received in court fees paid by the Treasury Solicitor to obtain extensions of time to file acknowledgements of service? 

14.  What was the total cost to the Tribunal in processing Judicial Review applications? 

15.  What is the unit cost per Judicial Review incurred by the Tribunal? 

.
Your request has been passed to me because I have responsibility for answering requests relating to Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunal Service in London and is being handled under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
I can confirm that HM Courts & Tribunal Service holds some of the information that you have asked for, and I am pleased to provide this to you. I have listed your responses below in the same order as your request.
1. Since October 2011 how many Judicial Review applications have been transferred from the administrative court to the Upper Tribunal? 
·  The tables below show the number of Judicial Review applications received in the Upper Tribunal and the number transferred from the Administrative Court to the Upper Tribunal since October 2011
	Num   Number  received in the Upper Tribunal 

	Topi   Topic
	Oct-11
	Nov-11
	Dec-11
	Jan-12
	Feb-12
	Mar-12
	Apr-12
	May -12
	Jun-12
	Jul-12
	Aug-12
	Sep-12
	Oct-12
	Nov-12
	Dec-12
	Jan-13

	Asylum Fresh Claim
	0
	4
	11
	9
	17
	16
	12
	18
	13
	15
	6
	15
	10
	8
	6
	8

	Clai      Human Rights 

Fres     Fresh Claim
	0
	0
	1
	1
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1

	Total    Total 
	0
	4
	12
	10
	17
	16
	12
	18
	13
	15
	7
	15
	10
	8
	6
	9


	Num   Number transferred from Administrative Court Office to the Upper Tribunal 

	Topi    Topic
	Oct-11
	Nov-11
	Dec-11
	Jan-12
	Feb-12
	Mar-12
	Apr-12
	May -12
	Jun-12
	Jul-12
	Aug-12
	Sep-12
	Oct-12
	Nov-12
	Dec-12
	Jan-13

	Asylum Fresh Claim
	11
	31
	39
	34
	38
	43
	36
	31
	29
	30
	38
	16
	37
	44
	33
	26

	Clai      Human Rights 

Fres     Fresh Claim
	1
	12
	7
	8
	4
	10
	13
	8
	12
	9
	9
	3
	9
	5
	7
	18

	Total    Total 
	12
	43
	46
	42
	42
	53
	49
	39
	41
	39
	47
	19
	46
	49
	40
	44


2.      How many of these Judicial Reviews requested that a decision be made with regards to removal directions? 
· This information is not recorded on our database.  This information is not held by Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunals Service as there is no legal or business requirement for Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunals Service   to collate the information being requested. 

3.      How many of these Judicial Reviews contained a request to be considered as urgent? 
· This information is not recorded on our database.  This information is not held by Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunals Service as there is no legal or business requirement for Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunals Service  to hold collate the information being requested. 

4.      How many of these Judicial Reviews were granted permission to proceed? 
· The table below shows the number of Judicial Review applications granted permission (including renewed applications).  

	Number Granted Permission  

	Topic
	Oct 11 - Mar 12
	Apr-12
	May-12
	Jun-12
	Jul-12
	Aug-12
	Sep-12
	Oct-12
	Nov-12
	Dec-12
	Jan-13

	Asylum Fresh Claim
	24
	2
	3
	3
	6
	4
	5
	7
	7
	5
	8

	Human Rights Fresh Claim
	5
	0
	0
	0
	1
	3
	1
	0
	0
	0
	1

	Total
	29
	2
	3
	3
	7
	7
	6
	7
	7
	5
	9


5.      How many of these Judicial Reviews were refused permission to proceed? 
· The table below shows the number of Judicial Review applications refused permission (including renewed applications). 

	Number Refused Permission  

	Topic
	Oct 11 - Mar 12
	Apr-12
	May-12
	Jun-12
	Jul-12
	Aug-12
	Sep-12
	Oct-12
	Nov-12
	Dec-12
	Jan-13

	Asylum Fresh Claim
	106
	28
	24
	24
	42
	39
	42
	22
	31
	26
	31

	Human Rights Fresh Claim
	21
	9
	1
	10
	10
	10
	5
	5
	6
	5
	13

	Total
	127
	37
	25
	34
	52
	49
	47
	27
	37
	31
	44


6.   How many of these Judicial Reviews were withdrawn by the claimant? 

7.   How many of these Judicial Reviews were withdrawn by the consent of both parties? 

· 6/7  The table below shows the number of judicial reviews withdrawn. Her Majesty’s Courts and Tribunals Service does not record how many cases were withdrawn by consent  as this information is not collated centrally , can inform you that if the application has been served, the withdrawal must be by consent of both parties.
	Num   Number withdrawn 

	Topi   Topic
	Oct-11
	Nov-11
	Dec-11
	Jan-12
	Feb-12
	Mar-12
	Apr-12
	May -12
	Jun-12
	Jul-12
	Aug-12
	Sep-12
	Oct-12
	Nov-12
	Dec-12
	Jan-13

	Asylum Fresh Claim
	0
	0
	2
	4
	3
	8
	9
	7
	17
	13
	11
	5
	12
	5
	21
	14

	Clai      Human Rights 

Fres     Fresh Claim
	0
	1
	0
	0
	0
	2
	3
	3
	2
	3
	3
	1
	1
	0
	4
	2

	Total    Total 
	0
	1
	2
	4
	3
	10
	12
	10
	19
	16
	14
	6
	13
	5
	25
	16


8.      How many oral hearings were heard following Judicial Review applications? 
9.      How many cases were allowed following an oral hearing? 

10.     How many cases were refused following an oral hearing? 
· 8/9/10. The table below shows the number of substantive hearings heard, broken down into the number allowed and dismissed

	 Substantive Decisions 

	Topic
	Oct 11 - Mar 12
	Apr-12
	May-12
	Jun-12
	Jul-12
	Aug-12
	Sep-12
	Oct-12
	Nov-12
	Dec-12
	Jan-13

	Asylum Fresh Claim Allowed
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0

	Asylum Fresh Claim Dismissed
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0
	1
	0

	Human Rights Fresh Claim Allowed
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0

	Human Rights Fresh Claim Dismissed 
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0

	Total
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1
	0
	1
	0


11.     How many injunctions preventing removal of an individual were issued by the Upper Tribunal? 
· This information is not collated by Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunals Service because there is no legal or business requirement for Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunals Service to hold the information being requested. 

12.     What was the total revenue received in court fees paid by claimants? 
· The total revenue received in court fees paid by claimants or their legal representatives between Oct 2011 and Jan 2013 was £70621.00.  This does not include any fees where the claimant is exempt from paying a fee.

13.     What was the total revenue received in court fees paid by the Treasury   Solicitor to obtain extensions of time to file acknowledgements of service? 
· The total revenue received in court fees paid by the Treasury Solicitor to obtain extensions of time to file acknowledgments of service between Oct 2011 and Jan 2013 was £33430.  

14. What was the total cost to the Tribunal in processing Judicial Review applications? 

· This information is not collated by Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunals Service as there is no legal or business requirement for Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunals Service to hold the information being requested. 

15.     What is the unit cost per Judicial Review incurred by the Tribunal? 
· I can confirm that Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunals Service, does not hold the information that you have requested
UNCLASSIFIED


