Air Command Secretariat
Spitfire Block

Headquarters Air Command
Royal Air Force

Ministry Buckinghamshire
of Defence ripia aUE

Ref: FOI2019/03450

16 April 2019

Dear I

Thank you for your e-mail of 18 March 2019, which has been considered to be a
request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA).

In your e-mail you clarified the following:

In your response you said "For instance, we may be able to retrieve and
extract the relevant data for Question 2, if you reduce the expanse of your
request from all RAFAC personnel to a particular ATC Wing." To clarify,
Question 2 does not refer to the personnel authorised to use the
equipment, | am only interested in what equipment is authorised to be
used by RAFAC personnel and the training they would need.

Please limit the scope of questions 2-10 to the time period of 1/1/18 to
present.

| amend question 3 to as follows - A list of radio equipment (including
masts, antennas, all types of radio transceivers on all bands and all other
equipment used in the training of the RAFAC or Amateur Radio
syllabuses) held by West Scotland Wing ATC and Scotland & Northern
Ireland Region ATC (Please include both Regional Radio Training Cell
and SNI equipment held at any location).

Please limit the scope of questions 4, 6, 7 and 10 to SNI Region. If this is
too broad of a request, please limit the scope of questions 4, 6, 7 and 10
to West Scotland Wing.

| amend question 7 to only include radio equipment held at all RAFAC
Regional Activity Centres

Please amend question 8 to include a request of the location of the course



e If question 8 is too broad of a request, please limit the request to only
Scotland

This is clarification in relation to your original request, as follows:

1) All materials involved in the deliver of all modules of the Silver and
Gold communication courses. Please include all powerpoints, handouts,
training exercises, instructor guides etc. Please include draft and
completed material from 1/1/16 onwards. If this is too broad of a request,
please limit the scope to Scotland & Northern Ireland Region only.

2) A list of all equipment authorised to be used by RAFAC personnel in the
delivery of the radio training such as radio transceivers, masts, antennas
etc. Please also include the training required to operate this equipment.

3) A list of radio equipment (including masts, antennas, all types of radio
transceivers etc) ,available for Sqns/Wing to use/borrow held within the
Scotland & Northern Ireland Region.

4) The number of cadets who achieved foundation/intermediate/full
amateur radio licences since 2012. Please break this down into number of
gualifications per year and (if available) location of course undertaken.

5) Information as to what the lawful authority of a Master Authority
Operating Certificate (MOAC) is. Please include references if possible.

6) The number of MOACSs revoked since 2012. Please include the Sgn
number (or if this is not possible the Wing/Region) affected and reason for
revoking the certificate. Please do not include MOACSs revoked due to time
lapsed or qualified staff leaving, | am seeking only those revoked due to
lack of discipline, breach of procedure, committing criminal offences etc.

7) A list of equipment available at all Regional Activity Centres (RACSs). If
this is too broad of a request, please limit the scope to Scotland &
Northern Ireland Region only.

8) The availability of ACF Signals courses to ATC cadets. Please include
number of courses, name of the course and places given per year.
Please include figures from 2012 including 2019 figures if available.

9) The number of instructors/assessors per module of the radio syllabus
(Blue, Bronze, all 3 Silver modules, all gold modules). If this is too broad of
a request, please limit the scope to Scotland & Northern Ireland Region
only.



10) Approved styles of HF antenna for use on Sqgn, guidance on
placement of these and list of funding schemes available for HF antennas
and transceivers.

A search for the information has now been completed, and | can confirm that
some information in scope of your request is held.

Question 1. The Silver and Gold communication courses are currently under
development. There is no recorded information held on the Gold communications
course. Please find the draft Instructor Guide and draft PowerPoint slides for the
Advanced Radio Operator Course and Foundation Radio Licence for the Silver
communications course attached at Annex A.

Question 2 and 3. No information held.

Question 4. RAF Air Cadets (RAFAC) do not offer the intermediate or full
amateur radio qualifications. The number of Air Cadets in the Scotland and
Northern Ireland Region who have achieved foundation level since 2012 is 8.
This information is not collated by course location or by year. The number of Air
Cadets who subsequently go on to apply for the foundation amateur radio licence
following completion of the foundation level course and exam is not recorded.

Question 5. Please find attached, at Annex B, the authority to radiate from Joint
Spectrum Authority (JSA), MOD Blandford. The Master Authority Operating
Certificate (MAOC) is the dissemination of this authority.

Question 6. The number of MAOCs revoked since 2012 is nil.

Question 7. Information not held.

Question 8. The Army Cadet Force (ACF) Signals courses are not currently
available to Air Cadets. Historical data is not held.

Question 9. The instructor/trainer and assessor ratio is one of each for the
various modules. Please see table below for the breakdown of the number of
trainers and assessors in the Scotland and Northern Ireland region:

Cadet Region Advanced Radio | Basic Radio Basic Radio
Operator Operator Operator
Trainer/Assessor | Assessor Trainer/Assessor
Scotland & Northern ~ 35 18
Ireland

Due to the small populations generated by this level of detail, and the possibility
of identifying individual personnel, data has been suppressed and "~" denotes a
number less than or equal to 5.




Question 10. There are no approved styles for HF antenna. Guidance is given
on a case-by-case basis dependent on unit location and size. There are no
funding schemes available.

In accordance with the Data Protection Act, under S40(2) of FOIA (third party
personal data), information contained within the presentation material at Annex A
and B is withheld as exempt information. This is an Absolute Exemption and not
subject to the Public Interest Test.

If you have any queries regarding the content of this letter, please contact this
office in the first instance.

If you are not satisfied with this response or wish to complain about any aspect of
the handling of your request, then you should contact me in the first instance. If
informal resolution is not possible and you are still dissatisfied then you may
apply for an independent internal review by contacting the Information Rights
Compliance Team, Ground Floor, MOD Main Building, Whitehall, SW1A 2HB (e-
mail CIO-FOI-IR@mod.uk). Please note that any request for an internal review
must be made within 40 working days of the date on which the attempt to reach
informal resolution has come to an end.

If you remain dissatisfied following an internal review, you may take your
complaint to the Information Commissioner under the provisions of Section 50 of
the Freedom of Information Act. Please note that the Information Commissioner
will not normally investigate your case until the MOD internal process has been
completed. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: Information
Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9
5AF. Further details of the role and powers of the Information Commissioner can
be found on the Commissioner’s website at https://ico.org.uk/.

Yours sincerely,

Air Command Secretariat

Encs:

Annex A - Draft Instructor Guide: Advanced Radio Operator (Silver VP Award
Level) and, draft Powerpoint slides for Advanced Radio Operator Course and
Foundation Radio Licence: Silver Badge Module.

Annex B - JSA Authority to Radiate - Air Cadets VHF & UHF



















































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































