
Full Name of Applicant  

 

 

Christopher Beal 

Title of Former Civil Service Role  

 

Deputy Director, MoJ Transformation 

 

Date Left  

 

Christopher left the Civil Service on 14 
October 2018. 

New Employer 

 

KPMG LLP 

 

New Appointment/Employment (including 
when taken up) 

 

15 October 2018 

Job Title: Senior Manager 

Proposed duties: Management consulting 
services. 

Department’s Decision on Application 
(including details of any waiting period or 
other conditions or restrictions applied) 

Chris should not draw on (disclose or use 
for the benefit of himself or the work to 
which this advice refers) any privileged 
information (which shall include any 
materials in any form) available to Chris 
from his time in Crown service; and 
 
For two years since his last day in Crown 
service, Chis should not become 
personally involved in lobbying the UK 
Government, nor should he make use, 
directly or indirectly, of his contacts in 
Government and/or Crown service to 
influence policy or secure business for the 
benefit of KPMG. 
 
During his appointment with KPMG, for 
two years since his last day in Crown 
service, he should not have any 
involvement with MoJ projects or contracts 
that provide a service to the MoJ. 

 


