
Authority Area Cost Description 

Barnsley Y&H £380,000 

Housing and Migration: Activity focused on areas of high 
concentrations of private rented accommodation being accessed, 
predominantly, by migrants to Barnsley where there are issues, for 
example, around the local physical environment, fraud, 
exploitation and criminal activity.The remit will particularly focus on 
hearing and responding to concerns of the whole community on 
the impact of migration and promote understanding of local social, 
cultural and civic norms. 

Bolsover EM £1,264,396 

Building Resilience: A range of projects that will be focused 
around Shirebrook and the NG20 postcode area. These will 
include building community resilience by working with Shirebrook 
Academy School and the wider community, improvements to the 
market square, improving access to and quality of private sector 
housing, raising awareness of UK laws and social norms and 
increasing access to health related services. 

Bradford Y&H £1,388,000 

Changing Place (Stronger Bradford): Ensuring effective delivery 
and effective use of public services. Providing English language 
support, targeted youth work, additional school support and health 
support workers to enable migrant communities to navigate public 
services effectively, reducing the demand on and increasing the 
capacity of children’s social services, health services and schools 
in the local area.    

Bristol SW £321,750 

Carrying out both targeted and reactive rogue landlord and agent 
enforcement work across the city of Bristol using the full range of 
housing enforcement powers. 



Authority Area Cost Description 

Bristol SW £180,474 

Tackling an increase in migrant rough sleeping and associated 
anti-social behaviour, by providing support to those with prospects 
of employment or facilitating supported returns home for those 
where this is the most appropriate outcome. 

Bristol SW £126,228 

To deliver cohesion activities around Bristol, including events, 
citizenship workshops, and youth and schools engagement to 
bring different communities together, promote responsible 
citizenship, understanding and integration. 

Bristol SW £174,202 

To support development of an ESOL strategy for Bristol & West of 
England, alongside English language activity and a pilot ‘work 
zone’ project to support legal migrants who are keen to work to 
overcome specific barriers such as conversion of qualifications 
and particular language support to enable them to gain suitable 
employment and contribute to the local economy. 

Calderdale Y&H £430,000 

Together Calderdale: Supporting additional youth engagement, 
English language classes, establishing understanding of local 
social norms and housing/environmental enforcement, with a ward 
level focus around central Halifax, Ovenden and Mixenden to 
benefit the whole community with improved public environment. 

Cambridgeshire East £283,347 

Alcohol Misuse: Reducing alcohol-related crime, improving health 
outcomes and achieving greater social cohesion in Wisbech and 
Peterborough.  

Carlisle NW £89,500 

Improving the Private Rented Sector in Botchergate: Tackling 
rogue landlords through targeted inspection of residential and 
business premises to tackle substandard housing, poor food 
hygiene and improve the area for all residents. 
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Fenland East £86,400 

Migrant Outreach Service: Employing a full time Outreach Worker 
to respond to the local community’s concerns about migrant rough 
sleeping in Fenland and related issues of employer and landlord 
exploitation. 

Fenland East £89,657 

Grow it, Cook it, Share it, Compare it: Promoting the interaction 
and understanding of diverse communities in Wisbech through the 
growing, cooking and sharing of fresh produce. 

Hackney London £431,155 

Integrated Communities Project: Providing advice, signposting, 
and engagement, employment training and English lessons for 
migrants to allow them to contribute to their communities and 
reduce longer term reliance on public services. Providing capacity 
building and the training to Council Services and the local 
voluntary sector to their offer for migrants.   

Haringey London £33,250 

Understanding Haringey’s recent and emerging migrant 
communities: A research project to better understand the issues 
faced by recently arrived Eastern European communities in 
Haringey; where they turn to for advice and support; and their 
relationship with the wider community. This research includes 
interviews with a wide range of frontline professionals and is 
training peer researchers from these groups.  The research will 
help to identify interventions which could be used to support more 
effective integration of these communities and to reduce potential 
sources of tension. The project will help to develop more effective 
communications channels, and to provide accurate information 
about life in the UK. It is the evidence-gathering phase for a wider 
bid. 



Authority Area Cost Description 

Harrow London £398,160 

Harrow Migration Fund: A project to determine the educational 
needs of new arrivals; increase awareness of social norms, 
supporting new arrivals to integrate and giving new arrivals health 
screening. 

Hounslow London £281,414 

Combatting Rogue Landlords: To create a pro-active Housing 
Enforcement team to identify, inspect and effectively resolve 
Rogue Landlord issues. 

Hounslow  London £130,000 

Data, intelligence and local projects: An initiative to analyse 
migration data, predict local public service pressure points, and 
allocate money to projects to alleviate these pressures to the 
benefit of the whole community. 

Leeds Y&H £525,000 

Standards and Expectations: Establishing community networks in 
5 target areas deploying community champions to hear and 
counter concerns of the wider community and identify better 
understanding and adherence to social norms and values by new 
migrant communities. The aim is to encourage more appropriate 
use of public services.  

Lincoln City EM £440,846 

Vision 2020: Together, Let’s Tackle Lincoln’s Rogue Landlords: 
tackling known rogue landlords; employing housing enforcement 
officers to conduct street surveys and inspections of privately 
rented homes to improve housing conditions in the private rented 
sector. 

Lincolnshire EM £80,630 

Mapping, understanding and engaging Lincolnshire's 
communities: a project to improve local knowledge of the 
communities in Lincolnshire, identifying areas with high migration 
in order to help local organisations to work better together to 
support our communities. 



Authority Area Cost Description 

Lincolnshire EM £160,158 

Supporting Migrants to Access Health Care Services and 
Information: expanding the capacity of a Health Link Worker to 
include Adults Services to as well as children’s services, to 
continue working with the established Eastern European 
communities to reduce the burden on health services and improve 
access, waiting times and aid cohesion. 

Luton East £240,000 

Extending Luton Council’s multi-agency Rogue Landlord project to 
tackle landlords who ignore requirements to license their Houses 
of Multiple Occupation (HMOs); tackle ‘Beds in Sheds’ and illegal 
conversions, and help raise standards in the local private rented 
housing sector for the whole community. 

Luton East £310,930 

Tackling homelessness amongst eastern Europeans either by 
supporting them into a sustainable future in the local community 
through employment, or by facilitating a reconnection to their 
country of origin. 

Manchester NW £280,000 

Joint targeted inspections (between housing officers, fire officers 
and immigration enforcement) of rented properties to tackle rogue 
landlords and poor housing conditions in deprived areas of 
Manchester where migrants are concentrated, improving 
conditions for the whole community. 

Middlesbrough NE £300,000 

Supporting Settled Communities: Promoting integrated and 
resilient communities by providing training on common social and 
cultural values, facilitating community events, offering small grants 
to support volunteering and bringing together people of all 
backgrounds. 
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Middlesbrough NE £400,000 

Research and mapping project to improve understanding of the 
changing population in Middlesbrough and wider Teesside area, 
looking closely at Middlesbrough as a case study to understand 
needs and help with local service planning. 

Middlesbrough NE £721,843 

Improving attainment and cohesion in schools: Helping schools 
alleviate pressures associated with a large number of international 
children arriving within the school year  by supporting their smooth 
transition  with additional teaching staff and language support 
enabling a stronger level of attainment for all children and 
supporting better community cohesion between children of all 
backgrounds. 

Norfolk East £169,376 

Voluntary Repatriation Support Service: Providing support to 
foreign nationals in Norfolk (including families with dependent 
children) who are contemplating or agreeing to a voluntary return 
to their country of origin. 

Nottingham EM £2,435,712 

Nottingham Together: activity aimed at making our City better for 
everyone, focused around tackling rogue landlords, increasing 
English language support, reducing crime through tackling issues 
such as modern day slavery, and data mapping and evidence 
gathering to increase knowledge of local communities in order to 
target local authority services effectively and support community 
cohesion. 

Peterborough East £224,912 

Getting to Know You: A project delivered by volunteers from the 
established resident communities to improve English language 
skills across the diverse ethnic communities in the Peterborough 
area. 
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Peterborough East £94,200 

Social Media Resources: Developing a suite of information, advice 
and guidance videos to improve the resident and migrant 
communities’ understanding of local services, and rights and 
responsibilities. 

Rotherham Y&H £1,307,289 

Building Stronger Communities: Rotherham has an overarching 
strategy around Building Stronger Communities that emphasises 
that Rotherham is a shared community focusing on ensuring 
effective delivery and efficient use of public services. Providing 
English language support to help new migrant communities 
navigate services more efficiently and enable them to engage 
more effectively with the resident communities. Tackling 
exploitative practices such as modern slavery, addressing 
environmental health issues such as fly tipping, combatting anti 
social behaviour and criminal behaviour in public places and 
tackling disruptive behaviour in schools.    

Stockport NW £67,250 

Stockport Stronger Together:  Promoting cohesion by improving 
English language proficiency in bilingual children and adults, and 
providing opportunities for children and young people from 
different backgrounds to mix socially and build relationships 
through a schools linking programme. 

Stockport NW £64,400 

Improving awareness amongst migrant communities of how 
services work. Training front-line NHS staff on working with 
migrants to create more efficient, effective services for everyone. 

Stockton on 
Tees NE £471,386 

Stockton Town Centre – investing in our communities: Tackling 
Rogue landlords in Stockton town centre, increasing Community 
English language provision, providing additional language support 
in schools and supporting additional youth work all to improve 
community cohesion in Stockton. 
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Suffolk East £102,000 

Supporting Integration in Suffolk: Delivering a drop in service for 
migrants to help with issues such as housing, education, access 
to services and employment, reducing short term pressures on 
front line services including the need for those services to use 
interpreters. 

Suffolk East £135,000 

ESOL Provision in Suffolk: Delivering English language courses to 
meet gaps in local provision, including through workshops 
covering issues such as rights and responsibilities in the UK to 
promote integration and community cohesion. 

Swindon SW £278,700 

To improve housing safety and standards in central Swindon 
including housing and fire inspections and measures to address 
fly-tipping to improve the local environment for all residents. To 
also improve community engagement with public services and 
community projects across Broadgreen. 

Thanet SE £557,630 

Rogue Landlord and Community Cohesion Task Force: to tackle 
rogue landlords in Thanet and provide English language support 
to help migrants engage effectively with the local community. 

 


