
NOTICE OF ORDER- CHANGE OF PROCEDURE 

WILDLIFE AND COUNTRYSIDE ACT 1981 
SECTION 53 

 
Surrey County Council 

Footpaths Nos. 632 and 633 (Reigate) Definitive Map Modification Order 
2014 

 
Notice is hereby given that the above referenced Order has been 
submitted to the Secretary of State for Environment, Food and Rural 
Affairs for determination.  An Inspector will be appointed by the Secretary 
of State to determine the Order. 
 
The start date for the above Order is 06 July 2015.   
 
Consideration of the Order will take the form of exchanges of statements 
of case and comments on statements of case. 
 
The Inquiry that was to be held at The Old Council Chamber, Town Hall, 
Castle Field Road, Reigate, Surrey, RH2 0SH on Tuesday 8 December 
2015 has been cancelled.  
 
The effect of the Order, if confirmed without modifications, will be to modify 
the definitive map and statement for the area by adding thereto: 
 
Footpath No. 632 (Reigate) commencing from Bell Street (grid reference 
TQ 2539 5008) in a generally westerly direction for 145m to its junction 
with FP 633 (grid reference TQ 2525 5006).  Then in a generally north-
westerly direction for 272m to its junction with Park lane (grid reference TQ 
2503 5017). 
 
Footpath No. 633 (Reigate) commencing at its junction with FP 632 (grid 
reference TQ 2525 5006), to the north west of Reigate Priory and 
proceeding in a north westerly direction for 62m to the northern edge of 
Priory Park (grid reference TQ 2522 5011).  Then in a north-north-easterly 
direction for 123m to its junction with High Street (grid reference TQ 2524 
2022). 
 
Any queries relating to this Order should be referred to Clive Richards at 
The Planning Inspectorate, Rights of Way Section, Room 3/25 Hawk Wing, 
Temple Quay House, 2 The Square, Temple Quay, Bristol, BS1 6PN.  
Telephone: 0303 444 5502.  Email: clive.richards@pins.gsi.gov.uk.  
Please quote reference number FPS/B3600/7/109 on all correspondence. 
 
Any person wishing to view the statements of case and other documents 
relating to these Orders may do so by appointment at Surrey County 
Council, Countryside Access, Merrow Depot, Merrow Lane, Guildford, 
Surrey GU4 7BQ between the hours of 10.00am and 4.00pm from Monday 
to Friday (excluding bank holidays).  Contact Daniel Williams on 020 8541 
9245. 
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Timetable for sending in statements of case and comments 
 
Since all parties have already had the opportunity to submit statements of 
case, these steps will not be repeated. 
 
[By 10 November 2015] 
Everyone who has made an objection or representation, the Authority, the 
applicant (if applicable) and anyone who has written to us in respect of the 
Order must ensure that their comments on any or every other statement of 
case is received by the Secretary of State.  As soon as possible after the 
deadline, the Secretary of State will send copies of these comments to 
everyone else. 
 
Any other person wishing to make representations in writing to the 
Secretary of State in respect of the above Order(s) must do so in line with 
the timetable set out above. 
 
In fairness to the other parties everyone should keep to the timetable to 
ensure that statements of case and comments are received on time. 
 
All parties must keep to the timetable set out above and ensure that 
statements of case are received by the Secretary of State on time.  Late 
documents will be returned.  
 
 
 

Notice of order for w/r 

 


